

**HUNT COUNTY BID AWARD
 FORMAL BID #240-24, JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES
 Effective 1/1/24 through 12/31/24**

PRODUCT REQUIRED										
CARPETS & FLOORS		Chaney Paper, Inc.	Empire Paper Company	Latsons	Pacific Star Corporation	Pyramid School Products	Reinert Paper & Chemical	Unipak Corporation		
1	Hard as Nails Floor Finish or +=	25.35/cs/5	79.02/cs/4	72.00/cs/2 (1.25gal)	No Bid	No Bid	84.24/pail/5gal	No Bid		
2	Xtreme Off Floor Stripper or =	28.50/cs/5	97.75/cs/4	125.00/cs/4 (1gal)	No Bid	No Bid	72.73/cs/4/gal	No Bid		
3	Spray Buff or =	13.90/cs/4	31.78/12qts	56.00/cs/4 (1gal)	No Bid	No Bid	69.11/cs/4	No Bid		
4	24 oz. Cotton Saddle Mop Broom, 24" Push, w/136 Handle (for corrections)	3.99/ea	19.26/box/3	6.50/ea	No Bid	4.99/ea or 59.88/cs/12 12.99/ea or 77.94/cs/6	2.48/ea	No Bid		
5	Mop Bucket w/ Wringer, 26qt	20.35/ea	No Bid	29.00/ea	No Bid	77.94/cs/6	24.88/ea	No Bid		
6	Corn Brooms UNS 926Y (JV)	64.95/ea	113.73/ea	76.00/ea	No Bid	68.99/ea	60.91/ea	No Bid		
7	CLEANERS/DISINFECTANTS/ POLISHES	10.75/ea	No Bid	9.50/ea	No Bid	7.99/ea or 47.94/cs/6	15.02/ea	No Bid		
8	Rest Stop Bathroom Cleaner or =	38.99/cs/12	34.14/cs/12	51.00/cs/12	No Bid	No Bid	35.30/cs/12qts	No Bid		
9	Fabulose-Ocean Cool	12.99/gal	45.70/cs/4(1gal)	54.00/cs/4 (1gal)	No Bid	No Bid	30.32/4/gal	No Bid		
10	Crystal Bright Glass Cleaner or =	8.25/gal	42.00/cs/4	99.00/cs/4 (1gal)	No Bid	38.99/cs/12	30.46/4/gal	No Bid		

18,548

FILED FOR RECORD
 at 1:30 o'clock 9 M
DEC 27 2023

**HUNT COUNTY BID AWARD
FORMAL BID #240-24, JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES
Effective 1/1/24 through 12/31/24**

11	Ajax #14278 w/Bleach only	45.75/cs/24 gal	37.27/cs/24/21oz	42.00/cs/24/21oz	No Bid	42.99/cs/24/21oz	42.19/24/20oz	No Bid	
12	Liquid Bleach 128 oz 6/case	4.25/cs/6	23.63/cs/6-128oz 106.10/16pks/cs/ 50	28.00/cs/6 (1gal)	46.84/pk/24	42.85/cs/6 (1gal)	23.99/6/gal	No Bid	
13	CSDW300W Wiper (800 wipes)	64.20/cs/800	120.81/cs/12 (19oz)	55.00/bucket/800	No Bid	No Bid	57.67/cs/10/120	No Bid	
14	Lysol IC3 #REC95029	112.00/cs/12	38.97/cs/12-24oz	149.00/cs/12 (19oz)	152.90/pk/12	132.98/cs/12 (19oz)	55.08/cs/12/20oz	No Bid	
15	Lysol IC (Pink) Foam Cleaner #REC95524	46.40/cs/12	51.73/cs/12-20oz	55.00/cs/12	55.30/pk/12	52.98/cs/12 (24oz)	41.34/cs/12/20oz	No Bid	
16	Time Mist A/F Citrus, Wildflower, Fresh Linen & Vanilla	48.75/cs/12	No Bid	89.00/cs/12	No Bid	39.98/cs/12	58.99/cs/12/7oz	No Bid	
17	Spray Pak Disinfectant Spray	45.50/cs/12	111.16/cs/12- 19oz	47.00/cs/12	No Bid	38.99/cs (16.5oz) 129.98/cs/12 (19oz)	55.08/cs/12/20oz	No Bid	
18	Professional Lysol Disinfectant #RAC74828	83.40/cs/12	38.44/cs/12	139.00/cs/12 (19oz)	139.63/pk/12	50.99/cs/12	55.08/cs/12/20oz	No Bid	
19	CLO 01593 Wipes (JV)	22.25/cs/6	59.30/cs/12	48.00/cs/12	52.59/pk/12	69.98/cs/12	18.20/cs/6/75	No Bid	
20	Pledge Dust Wipes #DRKCB121289	63.50/cs/12	70.00/cs/12	70.00/cs/12	No Bid	65.90/cs/12/24		No Bid	
FEMININE PRODUCTS									
21	Playtex Tampons, Super Non-Vend or =	66.85/cs/500- Hospeco	72.92/cs/500	140.00/cs/500	No Bid	71.95/cs/500	65.32/cs/500	No Bid	
22	Feminine Napkins #4 Maxi Thins or =	53.50/cs/250- Hospeco	64.13/cs/250	65.00/cs/250	No Bid	47.98/cs/250	75.05/cs/250	No Bid	
HAND SOAP/CLEANER/ SANITIZERS									
23	Debs Azure Foam Soap	59.95/cs/6	No Bid	80.50/cs/6	No Bid	No Bid	42.63/cs/6/1000m	No Bid	
24	DER410 Pink Hand Soap or =	7.50/gal	No Bid	35.00/cs/4gal	34.99/pk/4	No Bid	31.10/cs/4/gal	No Bid	

**HUNT COUNTY BID AWARD
FORMAL BID #240-24, JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES
Effective 1/1/24 through 12/31/24**

25	GOJ 3659-12 Purell Instant Hand Sanitizer	78.00/cs/12	58.02/cs/12	70.00/cs/12	66.71/pk/12	65.98/cs/12	64.76/cs/12/12oz	No Bid	
26	GOJ 2156-08 Hand Sanitizer	65.00/cs/4	117.68/8/1ltr	135.00/cs/8	121.45/pk/8	132.95/cs/8	68.86/cs/6/1000m	No Bid	
27	Lice Shampoo (1) Gallon Jugs	84.50/gal	No Bid	71.50/gal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
28	Clippercide - 15 oz. can	64.90/cs/6	No Bid	84.00/cs/12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
29	Dawn Dish Soap PGC45112	53.80/cs/8	52.10/cs/8-32oz	60.00/cs/8	65.65/pk/8	61.98/cs/8	62.59/cs/8/38oz	No Bid	
30	Clorox Cream Cleaner #CLO30613	59.50/cs/8	37.14/cs/8-32oz	43.50/cs/8	54.41/pk/8	55.95/cs/8	50.86/cs/8/32oz	No Bid	
31	WD 40 WDF49008	81.52/cs/12	95.60/cs/12-16oz	115.00/cs/12	134.49/pk/12	109.98/cs/12	53.29/cs/12/20oz	No Bid	
GLOVES & PERSONAL ITEMS									
32	Nitrile Powder Free Tex Blue Gloves N201, N202, N203, N204	34.65/cs/10	No Bid	54.50/cs/10	No Bid	44.90/cs/10	34.99/cs/10	5.60/box(100 box)	
33	Nitrile Powder Free Tex ONYX Gloves N641, N642, N643, N644	35.20/cs/10	No Bid	49.50/cs/10	95.16/pk/1000	No Bid	48.92/cs/10	5.60/box(100 box)	
PAPER & PLASTIC									
34	Copy Paper, Letter Brightness 92 (multipurpose) 5000 sheets/box	47.35/cs/10	47.45/cs/10	35.00/cs/10	124.26/pk/5000	No Bid	47.95/cs/10	No Bid	
35	Copy Paper, Legal Brightness 92 (multipurpose) 5000 sheets/box	74.40/cs/10	66.18/cs/10	71.00/cs/10	159.31/pk/5000	No Bid	57.49/cs/10	No Bid	
36	Facial Tissue, #AFF100, 2 ply 30/cs	28.50/cs/30	27.20/cs/30	25.50/cs/30	No Bid	No Bid	18.85/cs/30	No Bid	
37	Livi 11513, 2ply, 30/cs	28.50/cs/30	27.20/cs/30	27.00/cs/30	No Bid	32.98/cs/30	38.94/cs/96	No Bid	
38	Roses Toilet Tissue	49.50/cs/96	49.97/cs/96	55.00/cs/96	No Bid	No Bid	38.94/cs/96	No Bid	
39	9" Jumbo Toilet Tissue, 2 ply 2000' Roll or =	26.95/cs/12	34.63/cs/12	38.50/cs/12	54.77/pk/8	No Bid	42.38/cs/6/2000'	No Bid	

HUNT COUNTY BID AWARD
FORMAL BID #240-24, JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES
Effective 1/1/24 through 12/31/24

40	Toilet Tissue, 500, 2ply, Nova 4131	42.50/cs/96	49.97/cs/96	55.00/cs/96	No Bid	No Bid	28.94/cs/96	No Bid
41	Toilet Seat Covers, White #BWK2500 5000/cs	20.90/cs/10	61.83/cs/20	31.00/cs/10	42.11/pk/2500	37.95/cs/5000	30.71/cs/20(250)	No Bid
42	Right Choice Kitchen Towel Roll or = Right Choice Natural Roll Towel, 8"x350' roll Brown or=	27.85/cs/30	30.72/cs/30	33.50/cs/30	No Bid	No Bid	27.86/cs/30	No Bid
43	White Roll	27.60/cs/12	24.83/cs/12	28.00/cs/12	No Bid	No Bid	28.97/cs/12(350)	No Bid
44	White Roll, Towel, 8" x 350' roll White or = Nova 200 Brown Multi-fold towels 9 1/4 x 9 1/2	33.50/cs/12	27.00/cs/12	33.50/cs/12	54.90/pk/12	No Bid	32.92/cs/12(350)	No Bid
45	Urinal Screens KRY 1001	23.90/cs/16	22.61/cs/16	24.00/cs/16	No Bid	No Bid	23.64/cs/16(250)	No Bid
46	Urinal Deodorizer Blocks #KRYU0333	14.95/box/12	14.26/box/12	16.00/cs/12	15.34/pk/12	11.99/cs/12	23.57/box/10	No Bid
47	Urinal Wall Blocks #KRYV16	13.50/box/12	7.11/box/12	13.00/box/12	No Bid	10.99/cs/12	12.97/box/12/4oz	No Bid
48	Styrofoam Cups, 6oz Dart 6J6 or =	28.00/box/12	No Bid	45.00/box/6	No Bid	199.98/cs/36	41.66/box/6	No Bid
49	Styrofoam Cups, 12oz Dart 12J12 or =	28.80/cs/1000	32.69/cs/40(25)	39.99/cs/40 (25)	40.78/pk/40	No Bid	35.11/cs/40(25)	No Bid
50	Paper Cups #F100, 1oz.	47.70/cs/1000	50.36/cs/40(25)	64.50/cs/40	78.69/pk/40	No Bid	55.73/cs/40(25)	No Bid
51	Cone Drinking Cups, #42F	36.40/cs/2500	58.99/cs/20(250)	52.50/cs/20(250)	No Bid	No Bid	66.02/cs/20(250)	No Bid
52	Styrofoam Food Trays 3 compartment Carry Out 85HT3 (JV)	75.20/cs/5000	75.83/cs/25(200)	2.89/bag/200	No Bid	No Bid	81.66/cs/25(200)	No Bid
53	Plastic (Forks) White DART F6 BW	23.50/cs/200	18.88/cs/200	77.00/cs/500	No Bid	No Bid	16.03/cs/200	No Bid
54	Plastic (Spoons) White DART S6 BW	9.99/cs/1000	No Bid	38.00/cs/1000	36.50/pk/1000	No Bid	8.93/box/1000	No Bid
55		9.99/cs/1000	No Bid	38.00/cs/1000	35.66/pk/1000	No Bid	9.53/cs/1000	No Bid

HUNT COUNTY BID AWARD
FORMAL BID #240-24, JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES
 Effective 1/1/24 through 12/31/24

56	Plastic (Knives) White DART K6 BW	9.99/cs/1000	No Bid	35.00/cs/1000	31.90/pk/1000	No Bid	12.58/box/1000	No Bid
57	Paper Plates, 8 5/8" DIX 5 X P9" SAGE	84.50/cs/1000	No Bid	125.00/cs/1000	No Bid	No Bid	38.84/cs/500	No Bid
58	Paper Bowls, 10 oz DIX 5 X 12" SAGE	53.90/cs/1000	No Bid	68.00/cs/1000	No Bid	No Bid	105.80/cs/1000	No Bid
MISC ITEMS & CLEANING TOOLS								
59	Dust Pan, 12" Plastic Hand Held	8.50/lea	3.16/lea	3.00/lea	No Bid	1.99/lea	10.16/lea	No Bid
60	Toilet Bowl Brush, Stiff Bristle Minimum Length 19.5 Fiber Trim 2" Dia	4.50/lea	3.40/lea	3.00/lea	No Bid	1.79/lea	5.46/cs	No Bid
61	24x33 06N Can Liner	21.95/cs/1000	38.03/cs/20(50)	33.00/cs/1000	No Bid	No Bid	17.36/cs/1000	24.75/cs/1000
62	40x46 White Can Liner	21.80/cs/100	25.43/cs/4(25)	31.00/cs/100	No Bid	No Bid	20.10/cs/100	21.30/cs/100
63	43x47 HD Black	34.80/cs/100	52.84/cs/100	38.00/cs/100	No Bid	No Bid	24.59/cs/100	34.60/cs/100
64	38x58 XXHB Can Liner	38.99/cs/100	56.75/cs/100	48.00/cs/100	No Bid	No Bid	27.42/cs/100	37.50/cs/100
65	33x39 White Can Liner	24.25/cs/150	26.84/cs/6(25)	21.50/cs/100	No Bid	No Bid	17.06/cs/100	22.25/cs/150
67	Minimum Order Charge	No Minimum	No Minimum	No Minimum	Minimum Order Charge \$150.00	Minimum Order \$75.00	Minimum Order \$100.00	No Minimum
68	Delivery Charge	No Charge	No Charge	No Charge	N/A	\$15.95 if under \$75.00	No Charge	No Charge
69	Weekly Delivery Days	Wednesday & Friday	Thursday	Monday-Friday	Monday-Friday	Monday-Friday	Tuesday	Monday-Friday

The Purchasing Department recommends award to Chaney Paper/Vendor which best conforms to the Bid Specifications per LGC § 262.022 (5-a)